








Statement of Juan D. Reyes 
------------------------------ 
 
The fundamental reforms we need in state government begin with ballot access 
and strict term limits for all elected officials, legislative committee chairs, and floor 
leaders in both houses, including the Senate Majority Leader and Assembly 
Speaker. 
 
We can debate the merits of four or five terms as a maximum; but there must be 
a limit to career politicians. With fewer than 3% of New York' officeholders losing 
re-election each year, it's time to force this reform, just as the appointment of 
judges was necessary to take politics out of the selection of jurists.  
 
Free elections mean nothing if the average citizen cannot participate as a 
candidate, just as our nation's Founders envisioned. Reducing petition signature 
requirements from the current 5% to 1% would be a powerful start. 
 
The consolidation of power in the hands of the Senate Majority Leader, Assembly 
Speaker, and their central staffs is a serious threat to democracy and good 
government. 
 
Legislators who serve as committee chairs should be free to hire their own staff 
and hold hearings free of interference from the Speaker or Majority Leader.  
 
New York's state legislature, while considered a part-time legislative body, is one 
of the most well-paid state legislatures in the nation. If it is going to remain a part-
time legislative body, we need to curtail future legislative pay raises and 
increases in per diem expenses until they are more in line with that of part time 
legislators.  
 
If our legislature will not curtail future pay raises, we need to consider them 
fulltime legislators and enact strict limitations on their outside income --  to 
eliminate conflicts of interest, and force them to focus on their day jobs as public 
officials, not as rainmakers for their special interest sugar daddies. 
 
These political reforms, along with other budgetary and economic reforms are 
necessary if New York is ever to become the Empire State again. 
  
Campaign Promises 
  
I am prepared to fight for the reforms which I have outlined which will make this 
State great again. 
 
 


